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As people move through
different stages of life, there are
new financial opportunities — and
potential pitfalls — around every
corner. Have you made any of
these mistakes?

Your 50s and 60s
1. Raiding your home equity or retirement
funds. It goes without saying that doing so will
prolong your debt and/or reduce your nest egg.

2. Not quantifying your expected retirement
income. As you near retirement, you should
know how much money you (and your spouse,
if applicable) can expect from three sources:

• Your retirement accounts such as 401(k)
plans, 403(b) plans, and IRAs

• Pension income from your employer, if any
• Social Security (at age 62, at your full

retirement age, and at age 70)

3. Co-signing loans for adult children.
Co-signing means you're 100% on the hook if
your child can't pay, a less-than-ideal situation
as you're getting ready to retire.

4. Living an unhealthy lifestyle. Take steps now
to improve your diet and fitness level. Not only
will you feel better today, but you may reduce
your health-care costs in the future.

Your 40s
1. Trying to keep up with the Joneses.
Appearances can be deceptive. The nice
lifestyle your friends, neighbors, or colleagues
enjoy might look nice on the outside, but behind
the scenes there may be a lot of debt
supporting that lifestyle. Don't spend money
you don't have trying to keep up with others.

2. Funding college over retirement. In your 40s,
saving for your children's college costs at the
expense of your own retirement may be a
mistake. If you have limited funds, consider
setting aside a portion for college while
earmarking the majority for retirement. Then sit
down with your teenager and have a frank
discussion about college options that won't
break the bank — for either of you.

3. Not having a will or an advance medical

directive. No one likes to think about death or
catastrophic injury, but these documents can
help your loved ones immensely if something
unexpected should happen to you.

Your 30s
1. Being house poor. Whether you're buying
your first home or trading up, think twice about
buying a house you can't afford, even if the
bank says you can. Build in some wiggle room
for a possible dip in household income that
could result from leaving the workforce to raise
a family or a job change or layoff.

2. Not saving for retirement. Maybe your 20s
passed you by in a bit of a blur and retirement
wasn't even on your radar. But now that you're
in your 30s, it's essential to start saving for
retirement. Start now, and you still have 30
years or more to save. Wait much longer, and it
can be very hard to catch up.

3. Not protecting yourself with life and disability
insurance. Life is unpredictable. Consider what
would happen if one day you were unable to
work and earn a paycheck. Life and disability
insurance can help protect you and your family.
Though the cost and availability of life
insurance will depend on several factors
including your health, generally the younger
you are when you buy life insurance, the lower
your premiums will be.

Your 20s
1. Living beyond your means. It's tempting to
splurge on gadgets, entertainment, and travel,
but if you can't pay for most of your wants up
front, then you need to rein in your lifestyle,
especially if you have student loans to repay.

2. Not paying yourself first. Save a portion of
every paycheck first and then spend what's left
over, not the other way around. And why not
start saving for retirement, too? Earmark a
portion of your annual pay now for retirement
and your 67-year-old self will thank you.

3. Being financially illiterate. Learn as much as
you can about saving, budgeting, and investing
now and you could benefit from it for the rest of
your life.
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Marriage and Money: Taking a Team Approach to Retirement
Now that it's fairly common for families to have
two wage earners, many husbands and wives
are accumulating assets in separate
employer-sponsored retirement accounts. In
2018, the maximum employee contribution to a
401(k) or 403(b) plan is $18,500 ($24,500 for
those age 50 and older), and employers often
match contributions up to a set percentage of
salary.

But even when most of a married couple's
retirement assets reside in different accounts,
it's still possible to craft a unified retirement
strategy. To make it work, open communication
and teamwork are especially important when it
comes to saving and investing for retirement.

Retirement for two
Tax-deferred retirement accounts such as
401(k)s, 403(b)s, and IRAs can only be held in
one person's name, although a spouse is
typically listed as the beneficiary who would
automatically inherit the account upon the
original owner's death. Taxable investment
accounts, on the other hand, may be held
jointly.

Owning and managing separate portfolios
allows each spouse to choose investments
based on his or her individual risk tolerance.
Some couples may prefer to maintain a high
level of independence for this reason,
especially if one spouse is more comfortable
with market volatility than the other.

However, sharing plan information and
coordinating investments might help some
families build more wealth over time. For
example, one spouse's workplace plan may
offer a broader selection of investment options,
or the offerings in one plan might be somewhat
limited. With a joint strategy, both spouses
agree on an appropriate asset allocation for
their combined savings, and their contributions
are invested in a way that takes advantage of
each plan's strengths while avoiding any
weaknesses.

Asset allocation is a method to help manage
investment risk; it does not guarantee a profit or
protect against loss.

Spousal IRA opportunity
It can be difficult for a stay-at-home parent who
is taking time out of the workforce, or anyone

who isn't an active participant in an
employer-sponsored plan, to keep his or her
retirement savings on track. Fortunately, a
working spouse can contribute up to $5,500 to
his or her own IRA and up to $5,500 more to a
spouse's IRA (in 2018), as long as the couple's
combined income exceeds both contributions
and they file a joint tax return. An additional
$1,000 catch-up contribution can be made for
each spouse who is age 50 or older. All other
IRA eligibility rules must be met.

Contributing to the IRA of a nonworking spouse
offers married couples a chance to double up
on retirement savings and might also provide a
larger tax deduction than contributing to a
single IRA. For married couples filing jointly, the
ability to deduct contributions to the IRA of an
active participant in an employer-sponsored
plan is phased out if their modified adjusted
gross income (MAGI) is between $101,000 and
$121,000 (in 2018). There are higher phaseout
limits when the contribution is being made to
the IRA of a nonparticipating spouse: MAGI
between $189,000 and $199,000 (in 2018).

Thus, some participants in workplace plans
who earn too much to deduct an IRA
contribution for themselves may be able to
make a deductible IRA contribution to the
account of a nonparticipating spouse. You can
make IRA contributions for the 2018 tax year up
until April 15, 2019.

Withdrawals from tax-deferred retirement plans
are taxed as ordinary income and may be
subject to a 10% federal income tax penalty if
withdrawn prior to age 59½, with certain
exceptions as outlined by the IRS.

Open communication and
teamwork are especially
important when it comes to
saving and investing for
retirement.
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Should I cut the cord on cable?
In the last few years, it's
become common for
consumers to ditch cable
television in favor of streaming
services and devices. Many

affordable streaming options are available,
making it easier for consumers to give up cable
without necessarily sacrificing their favorite
shows. But there are some drawbacks to
relying exclusively on streaming services for
television viewing. Consider the following
before you decide to cut the cord.

The most obvious benefit of cutting cable is the
money you'll likely save each month. Compare
what you spend on your monthly bill to how
much of your cable subscription you actually
use. Are you regularly watching all the channels
you pay for, or do you watch only a few of
them? Are the channels you watch worth what
you pay each month? If not, it might make
sense to cancel cable and switch to an
alternative entertainment source.

You may decide to replace cable with a
streaming service or device. In addition to being
less expensive than cable, most services are
user-friendly. You won't need to flip through
hundreds of channels to find your favorite

shows, and as long as you have an Internet
connection, you can view them on the go on
your cell phone or tablet. Plus, streaming
services typically let you stop and start month
to month without termination fees.

But depending on your viewing preferences, a
streaming service might not be the right option
for you. There is often a delay in the online
release of many television shows, which can be
frustrating for dedicated viewers. And if you're a
sports fan, you might be disappointed to learn
that you won't have access to live sports
coverage through most streaming services.
Comprehensive sports packages are offered by
some services, but they can be expensive and
are not available in all regions.

Another disadvantage of switching to streaming
is that you may need to subscribe to multiple
packages or invest in special streaming devices
to access the programs you want. You might
also consider the cost of high-speed Internet —
you won't be able to stream without a relatively
fast Internet connection. Between multiple
subscriptions and reliable Internet, the cost of
streaming can add up quickly. Be sure to
compare prices and take advantage of any
free-trial offers.

Should I enroll in a health savings account?
A health savings account
(HSA) is a tax-advantaged
account that you can establish
and contribute to if you are
enrolled in a high-deductible

health plan (HDHP). Because you shoulder a
greater portion of your health-care costs, you'll
usually pay a much lower premium for an
HDHP than you would pay for traditional health
insurance. This allows you to contribute the
premium dollars you're saving to your HSA.
Then, when you need medical care, you can
withdraw HSA funds to cover your expenses, or
opt to pay your costs out-of-pocket if you want
to save your account funds. An HSA can be a
powerful savings tool, especially if your health
expenses are relatively low, since you may be
able to build up a significant balance in your
HSA over time. Before you enroll in an HSA,
ask yourself the following questions:

What will your annual out-of-pocket costs be
under the HDHP you're considering? Estimate
these based on your current health expenses.
The lower your costs, the easier it may be to
accumulate HSA funds.

How much can you afford to contribute to your
HSA every year? Contributing as much as you

can on a regular basis is key to building a
cushion against future expenses. For 2018, you
can contribute up to $3,450 for individual
coverage and $6,900 for family coverage.

Will your employer contribute to your HSA?
Employer contributions can help offset the
increased financial risk that you're assuming by
enrolling in an HDHP rather than traditional
employer-sponsored health insurance.

Are you willing to take on more responsibility for
your own health care? For example, to achieve
the maximum cost savings, you may need to
research costs and negotiate fees with health
providers when paying out-of-pocket.

How does the coverage provided by the HDHP
compare with your current health plan? Don't
sacrifice coverage to save money. Read all
plan materials to make sure you understand
benefits, exclusions, and all costs.

What tax savings might you expect? HSA funds
can be withdrawn free of federal income tax
and penalties provided the money is spent on
qualified health-care expenses. Depending on
the state, HSA contributions and earnings may
or may not be subject to state taxes. Consult
your tax adviser for more information.
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